
UK report underscores potential of e-cigarettes to reduce smoking harms 

Most of the harm from smoking could be prevented if a way could be found to provide the nicotine 
smokers crave without the harmful constituents of tobacco smoke.1 E-cigarettes have the potential 
to reduce smoking harms, but their population health impact depends on their uptake among 
smokers, the extent to which they completely displace smoking, and, crucially, their health effects 
compared with smoking. These factors must be weighed against any adverse impacts, such as 
uptake of e-cigarettes among nicotine-naive young people and their absolute health risks compared 
with using no nicotine products. A report commissioned by the UK Office for Health Improvement 
and Disparities, Nicotine Vaping in England: an Evidence Update Including Health Risks and 
Perceptions, 2022 by Ann McNeill and colleagues,2 provides the most rigorous and comprehensive 
review on this topic to date. This report's findings provide reassurance to smokers, health services, 
and policy makers. 
 
The report focuses predominantly on a large systematic review of the potential health risks of 
vaping. Studies of many types, ranging from in-vitro analyses to randomised controlled trials, most 
with small sample sizes, compared a range of biomarkers of exposure to nicotine and potential 
toxicants. They showed that people who vape are able to derive similar levels of nicotine as smokers 
but have substantially lower exposure to volatile organic compounds, tobacco-specific nitrosamines, 
and other toxicants,2 which are implicated in the onset of smoking-related diseases (eg, cancer, 
respiratory conditions, and cardiovascular disease).3 Although evidence on biomarkers of potential 
harm (eg, those that cause oxidative stress and inflammation) was limited, McNeill and colleagues 
concluded there was no evidence to cause concern.2 The report concludes that vaping poses a small 
fraction of the health risks of smoking. By implication, encouraging smokers to switch completely to 
vaping is likely to be an effective way to reduce the harms of smoking and improve population 
health. 
 
However, the report acknowledges that, although less harmful than smoking, vaping has some risks 
compared with not using any nicotine product. Studies that compared biomarkers of toxicant 
exposure between vapers and people who neither smoke nor vape indicated that although their 
exposure to many toxicants was similar, exposure to some harmful substances (eg, acrylonitrile, a 
possible carcinogen3) was higher among vapers.2 As such, people who have never smoked should be 
discouraged from taking up vaping (or smoking) to avoid unnecessary health risks. 
 
The Nicotine Vaping in England report suggests that health risks of vaping are often overstated, 
resulting in inaccurate risk perceptions that could deter people who use the most harmful product 
(cigarettes) from switching to less harmful product (e-cigarettes). According to representative 
surveys of young people (11–18 years) and adults (≥18 years) in England in 2021, 55°3% of young 
people and 65·9% of adult smokers and vapers in England mistakenly think that vaping is as harmful 
or more harmful than smoking.2 Such inaccurate perceptions have probably been fuelled by 
misrepresentative news coverage of e-cigarette harms, such as that of the US outbreak of vaping-
associated lung injury in 2019, which was caused by inhaling vitamin E acetate, an additive in 
cannabis vaping devices, rather than standard nicotine e-cigarettes.4 In an effort to uphold the 
precautionary principle, the health community may have inadvertently aided the promotion of 
misinformation.5 
 
Concerns about vaping harms also extend to policy. Although some governments, such as the UK 
Government, encourage smokers to switch to e-cigarettes,6 other governments, such as the 
Government of India, have prohibited the sale and use of e-cigarettes.7 The latter approach 
overlooks the potential for e-cigarettes to improve population health in the context of continued 



availability and use of cigarettes and other forms of smoked tobacco, which pose far greater danger 
to health.2 
 
The report used representative surveys to provide an update on vaping prevalence in England over 
time. These showed the proportion of adults (≥18 years) who vape has increased by around a 
percentage point each year; the prevalence of vaping among the adults surveyed was 6·3% in 2020, 
7·1% in 2021, and 8·3% in 2022.2 Over the same period, there has been a sharper rise in the 
proportion of young people (11–18 years) who vape: 8·6% of young people in England vaped in 
2022, compared with 4·0% in 2021 and 4·8% in 2020.2 This rise has coincided with a substantial 
increase in the proportion of young vapers who use disposable e-cigarettes, from 7·8% in 2021 to 
52·8% in 2022.2 Most major tobacco companies now include e-cigarettes in their product range. 
Such industry involvement is a cause for concern. E-cigarette companies use social media for 
advertising and product promotion;8 stronger regulation of this activity is needed to deter youth 
uptake of vaping.9 Although vaping is uncommon among never-smoking young people and adults in 
England (<2%),2 some countries, such as the USA,10 have seen a rise in prevalence among 
adolescents who have never smoked. It is important to monitor the impact of the rising popularity of 
newer disposable devices on vaping and smoking prevalence among youth and young adults,11 and 
consider how these products can be better regulated to make them less appealing to non-smokers. 
 
The report does not address the evidence for the effectiveness of e-cigarettes in helping smokers to 
quit. In England, e-cigarettes are the most popular quitting aid, used in one in every three quit 
attempts.12 The prevalence of e-cigarette use in quit attempts is generally lower in other countries 
with less supportive harm-reduction policies.13 The 2021 update of the living Cochrane review on e-
cigarettes for smoking cessation14 concluded with moderate certainty that nicotine-containing e-
cigarettes, used daily, are more effective than nicotine replacement therapy. This conclusion is 
supported by observational data that show strong associations between use of e-cigarettes and 
success in quitting at the individual and population level.15, 16  The Nicotine Vaping in England report 
concludes that the Cochrane findings on effectiveness and their own findings on health risks suggest 
that smokers should be encouraged to use e-cigarettes for stopping smoking, or as alternative 
nicotine delivery devices to reduce the harms of smoking.2 
 
From a clinical perspective, health providers should provide patients who smoke with information 
about the risks of vaping relative to continuing to smoke and how e-cigarettes can help them stop 
smoking. Public messaging should also convey the same messages. However, young people who 
have never smoked should be discouraged from starting to vape. This information needs to be 
communicated through evidence-based approaches that are non-punitive, foster informed 
discussion about substance use (eg, the role of industry in creating and driving demand for new 
nicotine products), and draw on an understanding of adolescent development in home, school, and 
community settings.17 Together with strengthened enforcement of restrictions on sales and 
advertising, sponsorship, and other marketing techniques, such approaches are more likely to be 
effective than simply telling young people to “say no” to vaping. 
 
This report advances the debate on e-cigarettes and their role in smoking cessation and in harm 
reduction. The main conclusion of the report—that although vaping poses only a fraction of the risks 
of smoking it is not risk-free, particularly for people who have never smoked—underlines the need 
for policy makers to strike the right balance for unique country contexts. Therein lies the challenge: 
at a global level, countries with weak tobacco control policies and poor regulation of legal and illegal 
markets of e-cigarettes and tobacco typically view and treat e-cigarettes as an additional burden to 
tobacco.18 However, other countries aspire to maximise the benefits of vaping while reducing 
unintended harms and in so doing have an opportunity to harness the potential of e-cigarettes in 
accelerating progress towards a smoke-free future. 
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