
Austerity, socioeconomic inequalities and stalling life expectancy in the UK: two parallel stories or 
one? 

 

May you live in interesting times (Chinese proverb) 

Undoubtedly, we live in interesting times. The 2008 economic crisis and feeble recovery from it, regional 
wars, global inequalities, international migration flows and subsequent political changes have changed 
our world in quite a dramatic way. One of the major changes many European countries have 
experienced in the 2010s is a slowdown in life expectancy improvement.[1] The decades-long steady 
improvement in life expectancy in the western world seems no longer to be the case. An extreme 
example is the USA, where life expectancy declined over three consecutive years between 2014 and 
2017.[2,3]  

In England and Wales, there is now realisation that improvements in mortality and life expectancy have 
slowed down or come to a halt.[4–6] The Office for National Statistics (ONS) estimates that between 
2011 and 2017 the rate of decline in mortality weakened by 85% in men and 95% in women in 
England,[6] while between 2014 and 2016 life expectancy stalled in both men and women in England. 
[7] On the basis of these data, the latest (updated) projection is that more than a million deaths will 
occur earlier than expected over the next 40 years.[8,9] This is one of the greatest slowdowns in life 
expectancy and mortality improvements observed in both men and women in England and Wales since 
1890.[6,10] The emerging increase in mortality in 2018 and prospect of further worsening of the long-
term life expectancy trend leave little room for optimism.[11]  

Despite disagreement regarding the underlying causes, it now seems apparent that this unprecedented 
slowdown in life expectancy in the UK is a longer-term change rather than a short-term 
irregularity.[8,11,12] It is also clear that for the period 2011-15 the UK had the second lowest increase in 
life expectancy in men and the lowest in women among 25 EU countries.[4] The UK was also the only 
country, among 20 European countries that experienced a spike in mortality in 2015, where life 
expectancy did not improve in 2016.[1,2] Another point that most analysts agree is that the slowdown in 
the life expectancy between 2011 and 2016 refers more to people ages ≥65 years, with women being 
more affected than men.[1,2,10,12] It should be noted though that it is the first time since at least 1986 
that infant mortality increased in two consecutive years, 2015 and 2016; a troubling new development 
[13,14]  

Another parallel reality is that of massive socioeconomic inequalities in life expectancy. The UK has 
experienced a steady improvement in life expectancy for decades before 2011, but these improvements 
were not distributed equally among social classes. In fact, they were distributed very unequally.[15] For 
the period 2013-15, men in the most affluent decile of the Index of Multiple Deprivation (IMD), a 
measure of area-based deprivation, were expected to live 9.1 years more than men in the most 
deprived decile of IMD, while the same figure in women is 7.2 years. The differences in healthy life 
expectancy by IMD deciles are even more astonishing. Men in the most affluent IMD decile were 
expected to live free of disease and disability 18.7 years more than men in the most deprived decile, 
while the same figure for women was 19.1 years. The picture gets grimmer considering that some of 
these inequalities are getting wider over time.[16,17] 

Many views have been offered about what might be the causes of the slowdown in life expectancy in 
the UK. [6,10,18]  The ensuing debate revolves around two main explanations: this of excess winter 
mortality [1,12] and that of social causes and austerity.[4,10,19] Winter outbreaks of flu and winter 



excess mortality may be a partial explanation,[12] but it is unlikely that they are the main drivers of a 
slowdown in life expectancy that spans eight years (2011-18). Flu epidemics involving common influenza 
strains are nothing new and have not resulted in similar long-term slowdown in life expectancy 
improvement in the UK in previous decades. Further, most winters between 2011 and 2018 were 
warmer than the 1981-2010 average (https://bit.ly/2rc3IL1), and there was no influenza pandemic 
between 2011 and 2017.  

In the absence of pandemics, natural disasters, war, or other major events that can directly affect vital 
statistics, an explanation based on of the social determinants of health approach appears to be 
relevant.[5] If social and economic factors determine the health of the population, then, it is these 
factors that we should be looking at when the health of the population deteriorates.[4] Of course, under 
this generic assumption, there is a very complex web of causation involving many interacting factors 
that awaits to be studied. Hiam and colleagues have made a strong case for public spending cuts and 
subsequent NHS and local authorities’ underperformance being important parameters of the problem 
and highlighted the inability of the health and social care system to address the increased needs of the 
population, especially during the winter, and effectively support the elderly. [10,19] It remains to be 
proven whether the suggested association between public spending cuts and the observed slowdown in 
life expectancy is causal. To this end, new pieces of the puzzle keep appearing [17,20]. An important 
new study suggests that between 2011 and 2016, life expectancy declined in women in the two most 
deprived IMD deciles (the estimated decline in women in the most deprived decile was 0.24 years), 
while it continued increasing in women at top IMD deciles (the estimated increase in women in the most 
affluent (tenth) decile was 0.38 years).[17] For the same period, life expectancy stalled for women in the 
third, fourth and fifth IMD deciles.[17] These findings not only draw a disconcerting picture of a society 
where poorer people no longer reap the benefits of a prosperous society, but importantly suggest that 
the problem of increased mortality and stalling life expectancy concerns more the poorest half of the 
population. Although clearly more research is needed on this key issue, the question follows: if the 
problem mostly concerns the poorer half of the population, should not the solution also mostly concern 
this part of the population?  

The main criticism to an austerity explanation is that countries like Greece that implemented harsher 
austerity policies did not experience a slowdown in life expectancy as great as that in the UK. [1,12] 
While this needs to be studied further and may be due to different reasons, the bigger picture is that 
fluctuations in mortality and a slowdown in life expectancy in many European countries in the 2010s 
were preceded by the very severe 2008 financial crisis and the austerity policies that followed.[4]  

Undoubtedly, we live in interesting times. It is the first time that life expectancy comes to a long-term 
halt in the UK. It is also the first time in at least fifty years that real median incomes in the UK have 
stagnated for 10 years and fallen below their historical growth rate to an unprecedented extent, while 
income inequalities and child poverty especially among workless households are on the rise [21] …it is 
time to act. 
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